
17-8037

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Laboratory Equipment Maintenance and

FOR: Repair for Organics Section

TIME & (September 1, 2017 through August 31, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

12 per month PRICE/

G1530N/6890N GC System R-21P-501/Petrochemical Bundle MONTH 87.00 Included in NO BID

1. Serial No.US10318098 TOTAL 1,044.00 Item 4

12 per month PRICE/

59864B/Ion Guage Controller R-21A-501/At your site repair MONTH 11.00 Included in NO BID

2. Serial No.US60100608 TOTAL 132.00 Item 4

12 per month PRICE/

G2613A / 7683 Autoinjector Tower Module Instrument Exchange MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

3. Serial No.US CN22726052 TOTAL 240.00 Item 4

12 per month PRICE/

G1099A/5973 Mass Spec Detector Standard-Turbo Mainframe R-21P-501/ MONTH 303.00 700.00 NO BID

4. Petrochemical Bundle, Serial No.US70820673 TOTAL 3,636.00 8,400.00

12 per month PRICE/

Teledyne Tekmar Stratum Purge & Trap MONTH 101.00 Included in NO BID

5. Serial No.  US12298005 TOTAL 1,212.00 Item 4

12 per month PRICE/

Teledyne Tekmar Aquatek 100 Vial Autosampler MONTH 146.00 Included in NO BID

6. Serial No. US13254002 TOTAL 1,752.00 Item 4

12 per month PRICE/

G3440B/7890 B GC System MONTH 112.00 233.35 NO BID

7. Serial No. CN15053165 TOTAL 1,344.00 2,800.20

12 per month PRICE/

G4514A.7693 Autosampler Tray Instrument Exchange MONTH 33.00 Included in NO BID

8. Serial No. CN15050064 TOTAL 396.00 Item 7

12 per month PRICE/

G4513A/7693A Autoinjector Tower Module Instrument Exchange MONTH 19.00 Included in NO BID

9. Serial No. CN14470219 TOTAL 228.00 Item 7

12 per month PRICE/

G4513A/7693A Autoinjector Tower Module Instrument Exchange MONTH 19.00 Included in NO BID

10. Serial No. CN14470161 TOTAL 228.00 Item 7

12 per month PRICE/

HP Monitori Z22i Model D7Q14A MONTH 9.00 Included in NO BID

11. Serial No. CNC4350T6G TOTAL 108.00 Item 7

12 per month PRICE/

HP CPU MONTH 25.00 Included in NO BID

12. Serial No.2VA4511Y4K TOTAL 300.00 Item 7

12 per month PRICE/

G3440A/7890A GC System MONTH 140.00 233.35 NO BID

13. Serial No. US10813092 TOTAL 1,680.00 2,800.20

12 per month PRICE/

62614A/7683 Autosampler Tray Module MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

14. Serial No. CN83250638 TOTAL 240.00 Item 13

12 per month PRICE/

G2913A/7683B Autoinjector Tower Module MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

15. Serial No. CN83152450 TOTAL 240.00 Item 13

12 per month PRICE/

G2913A/7683B Autoinjector Tower Module MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

16. Serial No. CN83152463 TOTAL 240.00 Item 13

12 per month PRICE/

HP Compaq Computer MONTH 25.00 Included in NO BID

17. Serial No. MXL0060Z3D TOTAL 300.00 Item 13

12 per month PRICE/

NK570A HP Monitor MONTH 9.00 Included in NO BID

18. Serial No. 3CQ94701RR TOTAL 108.00 Item 13

12 per month PRICE/

G3440/7890A GC System MONTH 87.00 Included in NO BID

19. Serial No. CN10843021 TOTAL 1,044.00 Item 20

12 per month PRICE/

5975C Inert Mass Spec Detector MONTH 303.00 467.00 NO BID
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17-8037

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Laboratory Equipment Maintenance and

FOR: Repair for Organics Section

TIME & (September 1, 2017 through August 31, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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20. Serial No. US83120984 TOTAL 3,636.00 5,604.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Laboratory Equipment Maintenance and

FOR: Repair for Organics Section

TIME & (September 1, 2017 through August 31, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
u

ll
 S

p
ec

tr
u

m
 A

n
al

y
ti

cs
, 

In
c.

1
2

5
2

 Q
u

ar
ry

 L
an

e

P
le

as
an

to
n

, 
C

A
 9

4
5

6
6

A
g

ile
n

t 
T

e
c
h

n
o

lo
g

ie
s
, 

In
c
.

T
h

e 
R

em
i 

G
ro

u
p

, 
L

L
C

1
1

3
2

5
 N

o
rt

h
 C

o
m

m
u

n
it

y
 H

o
u

se
 

R
d

.,
 S

u
it

e 
3

0
0

C
h

ar
lo

tt
e,

 N
C

 2
8

2
7

7

12 per month PRICE/

G2913A/7683B Autoinjector Tower Module MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

21. Serial No. CN83252686 TOTAL 240.00 Item 20

12 per month PRICE/

62614A Autosampler Tray Module MONTH 20.00 Included in NO BID

22. Serial No. CN83250670 TOTAL 240.00 Item 20

12 per month PRICE/

7890A GC System MONTH 87.00 Included in NO BID

23. Serial No. CN10843039 TOTAL 1,044.00 Item 24

12 per month PRICE/

5975C Inert Mass Spec Detector MONTH 303.00 584.00 NO BID

24. Serial No. US83120973 TOTAL 3,636.00 7,008.00

12 per month PRICE/

Teledyne Tekmar Stratum Purge & Trap MONTH 101.00 Included in NO BID

25. Serial No. US08266007 TOTAL 1,212.00 Item 24

12 per month PRICE/

Teledyne Tekmar Aquatek 100 Vial Autosampler MONTH 146.00 Included in NO BID

26. Serial No. US12314005 TOTAL 1,752.00 Item 24

 

TOTAL TOTAL 26,232.00 26,612.40 NO BID

EXTENSION 1 26,232.00

EXTENSION 2 26,232.00

EXTENSION 3 26,232.00

Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days  

*LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:  

 
Accurate Labs Edge Analytical Laboratories Demandstar

Advance Scientific & Chemical Eurofin Analytical SAWS Website

Agilent Technologies, Inc. Florida Spectrum Environmental

Analytical Instrumentation Svcs. Fox Scientific 

 Analytical Scientific Full Spectrum Analytics, Inc.

Anatek Labs Government Scientific Source
Armstrong Forensic Laboratory LCRA Headquarters

B&A Laboratories Microbac Laboratories

Babcock Laboratories Pace Analytical

Basic Laboratory PDC Laboratories

Biomedical Solutions Pratum Technologies
Calright Instruments Remi

Capitol Scientific Sercomp Int'l LLC

Compco Analytical Six Sigma Technology

Conquer Scientific Terra Technologies

Detection Instruments Test Equipment

Diversified Laboratory Repair TestAmerica

UL LLC
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SAWS Website
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